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Is 
there more than 

one student with the 
same LSP?

Yes No

Create hidden 
Groups according 

to LSP

Create individual 
exceptions in the 

Test Options

In Test Options > 
Exceptions add 

more time 
according to group

Arrange a specific date 
and time window with 

each student

In Test Options > 
Exceptions add more 

time. Including breaks in 
the total time

Yes, 
breaks are 

needed

No,
breaks are 
not needed

Turn off Force 
Completion checkbox

Restrict availability to the 
agreed time window 

(allowing for extra time 
and breaks)

Are 
there any students 

with LSPs taking this 
exam?

No
Review standard 

advice for setting up 
online exams

Are breaks 
specified in LSPs?

Check with 
individual 

students that 
breaks are 
required

Yes

Response 
from student/s

No
Are breaks  

specified in LSPs? No

Yes

What type of 
exam is this?

Set test 'availability' 
times to accomodate 
the longest LSP that 

applies, e.g. 50% extra 
time with breaks

Set Test Options to 
'Force Completion' so 
that students cannot 

re-enter the exam 
after allotted time

In Test Options > 
Exceptions add 
more time per 

individual student

End

Yes

Check with 
individual 

students that 
breaks are 
required

Response 
from student/s

Yes, 
breaks are 

needed

Test Options > 
Exceptions 

Turn off Force 
Completion checkbox

No,
breaks are 
not needed

Remote Exam with 
Time Window*:
a series of dates 
during which a 

time-limited exam 
can be taken

Invigilated Exam:
on a specific date, 
with a set start time
and end time with 
human supervision

Window* e.g. a 
5-day window to 
take a 1 hour 
exam. Not 
invigilated
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Is 
there more than 

one student with the 
same LSP?Yes

Create hidden 
groups according 
to LSP and add to 
Test Options > 

Exceptions

Create individual 
exceptions in Test 

Options > 
Exceptions

Test Options > 
Exceptions add 

more time 
according to group

Test Options > 
Exceptions make sure 
that the time allowed 

includes breaks and that 
breaks are calculated 
against the total time 

(including the extra time)

Are 
there any students 

with LSPs taking this 
exam?

No
Review standard 

advice for setting up 
online exams

Are breaks 
specified in the 

LSP/s?
Yes

Are breaks  
specified in the 

LSP/s? No

Yes

What type of 
exam is this?

Set test 'availability' 
time to the LSP with the 

longest duration that 
applies e.g., 50% extra 

time with breaks

Keep Test Option > 
Exceptions as 

'Force Completion' 
so that students 

cannot re-enter the 
exam after leaving 

the online call

Test Options > 
Exceptions add 

more time per 
individual student

End

Test Options > 
Exceptions 

Turn off the 'Force 
Completion' 
checkbox

Remote Exam with 
Time Window*:
a series of dates 
during which a 

time-limited exam 
can be taken

Invigilated Exam:
on a specific date, 
with a set start time
and end time with 
human supervision

Window* e.g. a 
5-day window to 
take a 1 hour 
exam. Not 
invigilated

V2

No Yes

Test Options > 
Exceptions 

Turn off the 'Force 
Completion' checkbox

No

Is 
there more than 

one student with the 
same LSP?

Create hidden 
groups according 
to LSP and add to 

Test Options > 
Exceptions

Create individual 
exceptions in Test 

Options > 
Exceptions

Yes No
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